
MEETINGS & EVENTS

The Club Privé Conservatory & Garden
is located on the lower ground floor of the 
House building. Warm and elegant, It has tall 
floor-to-ceiling windows that give it a unique 
outdoor charm. It is the perfect space for 
meetings for up to 10 people, leisurely private 
lunches or summer barbecues that can flow
in to the private garden.  

The Roseate Edinburgh brings unlimited charm 
and warmth to corporate meetings, events 
and get- togethers. Located just five minutes 
from Haymarket rail station & Murrayfield 
Stadium and less than 20 minutes’ drive from 
Edinburgh airport, The Roseate Edinburgh is 
perfectly nestled in Edinburgh’s West End. 

At The Roseate Edinburgh, we take pride in 
being a bespoke venue for special celebrations 
and occasions. Catering for everything from 
small weddings to baby showers and work 
get-togethers, we have the menu and the 
venue to suit your preference.

Club Privé
Make business a pleasure.
Club Privé is the perfect space for private 
meetings and events. It overlooks the verdant 
garden, has wafts of natural daylight and offers 
a delightfully elevating experience. Club Privé 
is designed to offer an exemplary experience 
for up to 36 guests seeking a private meeting 
space that offers not just style and luxury but 
also the best tech efficiencies. Designed to 
meet the demands of the new age hybrid 
meetings that transition seamlessly between 
virtual and physical, Club Privé offers an 
unparalleled experience, immaculate 
hospitality, exceptional service and bespoke 
private dining options.

The Dunstane Restaurant & Bar offers 
exemplary cuisine prepared with the finest 
Scottish produce, paired with the best spirits 
from Highland breweries and distilleries.

The Roseate Garden - a tale of warm 
sunshine, fresh breeze, butterflies and 
birdsong, The Roseate Garden is a charming 
verdant space to unwind over fine drinks and 
nibbles. The beautifully manicured gardens are 
stylishly appointed with cushioned benches 
and large round oak tables with sheepskin 
rugs. The space has a state of the art acoustic 
system to play calm ambient music.

At dusk, The Roseate Garden gets completely 
transformed into a delightful oasis, lit up with 
elegant festoon lights and heaters to provide 
warmth on chilly Scottish nights. The Roseate 
Garden is the perfect place for hosting a 
variety of events from barbecues and drinks 
parties to corporate events and even intimate 
wedding ceremonies. With a maximum 
capacity of 80 guests in a standing reception, 
to 22 guests seated under the covered and 
heated area with a private bar, The Roseate 
Garden promises an exemplary experience 
for guests seeking an eclectic private outdoor 
space. No matter the event, our team will 
make it truly unforgettable.

Club Privé

The Dunstane Restaurant & Bar 



To book, please contact us direct on: reservationsmgr.tre@roseatehotels.com  |  +44 020 7479 6600  l  www.roseatehotels.com  
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Long tables: 14

Theatre style: 30

Individual seating: 40
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